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Loan impairment methodology 
The Bank impairs financial instruments in accordance with Instruction №215 “On Procedure of 
Creation and Use of Reserve and Loan Loss Provision Fund” of the National Bank of Tajikistan.  
Since the amount of impairment according to the instructions of the National Bank of Tajikistan is  
higher than the amount of impairment in accordance with IFRS 9, the Bank used the amount of the  
accrual allowance in accordance with the instructions of the National Bank of Tajikistan for the 
purpose of prepare financial statements for the year ended December 31, 2019. Note 10 discloses 
information on loans with allowance for impairment in accordance with Instruction № 215 of the 
National Bank of Tajikistan. 
 
The Management of the Bank accrual allowances impairment in relation to financial instruments 
based on the terms of concluded agreements, assessing the financial condition of customers, as 
well as forecasting future cash inflow for obligations existing at the reporting date. 
 
We conducted procedures related to classify loans by risk group, the internal control system was 
evaluated, loans of individuals and legal entities were tested on a selective basis, including the 
calculation of impairment. We reviewed and evaluated key methods for identifying and classifying 
loans by risk group and existing models for calculating impairment for individuals and legal entities. 
 
Foreclosed assets 

We draw attention to the Note 15 to the financial statements. As of December 31, 2019 and 2018 
the Bank’s statement of the financial position presents foreclosed assets in the amount of 7 494 
thousand somoni and 6 773 thousand somoni, respectively, including allowance for impairment in 
the amount of 24 981 thousand somoni and 15 849 thousand somoni, respectively. Bank calculates 
the impairment for foreclosed assets in accordance with instruction of National Bank of Tajikistan.  
 
Legal actions 

We draw attention to Note 30, which describes the legal actions against the Bank. This paragraph 
describes the legal actions that were claimed for and against the Bank. 
 
Other matter 
Other matter paragraph – A paragraph included in the auditor’s report that refers to a matter other 
than those presented or disclosed in the financial statements that, in the auditor’s judgment, is 
relevant to users’ understanding of the audit, the auditor’s responsibilities or the auditor’s report. 

 
Methodology of impairment of loan portfolio 

In 2018, the Bank engaged an external consultant to develop a methodology and model for 
transforming the accounting of its financial instruments in accordance with IFRS 9 “Financial 
Instruments”. At present, the Bank continues to continue to impair financial instruments in 
accordance with Instruction № 215 “On Procedure of Creation and Use of Reserve and Loan Loss 
Provision Fund” of the National Bank of Tajikistan. Since the amount of impairment according to the 
instructions of the National Bank of Tajikistan is higher than the amount of impairment in 
accordance with IFRS 9, the Bank used the amount of the accrual allowance in accordance with the 
instructions of the National Bank of Tajikistan for the purpose of prepare financial statements for the 
year ended December 31, 2019. 
 
Going concern 

The financial statements of the Bank have been prepared using the going concern principle in 
accounting. The use of this accounting framework is appropriate unless the Management intends to 
liquidate the Bank or terminate its business, or it has no real alternative but to do so. As part of our 
audit of the financial statements, we came to the conclusion that the use by the Management of the 
going concern principle in accounting in preparing the financial statements of the Bank is 
appropriate. Management has not identified material uncertainty that could cast significant doubt on 
the Bank's ability to continue as a going concern, and therefore no such information is disclosed in 
the financial statements. 



  

 
 

 
Based on our audit of financial statements, we draw attention to the impact of the COVID-19 
coronavirus pandemic infection on the economic situation in the region and the reduction in cash 
flows associated with this epidemic.  
 

These events or conditions, along with other issues disclosed in the Note 4, indicate that there is 
material uncertainty that could raise significant doubts about the Bank's ability to continue as a 
going concern. We do not express a modified opinion in connection with this matter. 
 
Responsibilities of Management and Those Charged with Governance for the Financial 

Statement 

Management is responsible for the preparation and fair presentation of the financial statement in 
accordance with IFRS, and for such internal control as Management determines is necessary to 
enable the preparation of a financial statement that is free from material misstatement, whether due 
to fraud or error. 
 
In preparing the financial statement, Management is responsible for assessing the Bank’s ability to 
continue as a going concern, disclosing, as applicable, matters relating to going concern and using 
the going concern basis of accounting unless Management either intends to liquidate the Bank or to 
cease operations, or has no realistic alternative but to do so. 
 
Those charged with governance are responsible for overseeing the Bank’s financial reporting 
process. 

Auditor's responsibility for the audit of financial statements 

Our objectives are to obtain reasonable assurance about whether the financial statement as a 
whole is free from material misstatement, whether due to fraud or error, and to issue an auditor’s 
report that includes our opinion.  
 
Reasonable assurance is a high level of assurance, but is not a guarantee that an audit conducted 
in accordance with International Standard on Auditing (hereinafter “ISAs”) will always detect a 
material misstatement when it exists. Misstatements can arise from fraud or error and are 
considered material if, individually or in the aggregate, they could reasonably be expected to 
influence the economic decisions of users taken on the basis of this financial statement. 
 
As part of an audit in accordance with ISAs, we exercise professional judgment and maintain 
professional scepticism throughout the audit. We also: 
 

- identify and assess the risks of material misstatement of the financial statement, whether due 
to fraud or error; 

- design and perform audit procedures responsive to those risks, and obtain audit evidence that 
is sufficient and appropriate to provide a basis for our opinion. The risk of not detecting a material 
misstatement resulting from fraud is higher than for one resulting from error, as fraud may involve 
collusion, forgery, intentional omissions, misrepresentations, or the override of internal control; 

- obtain an understanding of internal control relevant to the audit in order to design audit 
procedures that are appropriate in the circumstances, but not for the purpose of expressing an 
opinion on the effectiveness of the Bank’s internal control; 

- evaluate the appropriateness of accounting policies used and the reasonableness of 
accounting estimates, if any, and related disclosures made by Management; 

- conclude on the appropriateness of Management’s use of the going concern basis of 
accounting and, based on the audit evidence obtained, whether a material uncertainty exists related 
to events or conditions that may cast significant doubt on the Bank’s ability to continue as a going 
concern. If we conclude that a material uncertainty exists, we are required to draw attention in our 








